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The City of Glendale negotiated reduced rates for Glendale residents to get landscaping services
that help property owners stay in compliance with City codes. Services included are lawn care,
tree/shrub trimming, dead tree removal, desert landscape maintenance, and installation of desert
landscape material. Below are two contarctors that may provide services which can be as low as
$27 per hour. For the complete list of rates, visit the Code Compliance web site at
hitps://www.glendaleaz.com/live/city services/property maintenance codes

Artistic Land Management, Inc.
Freddie Panzella
Estimator and Area Manager

480-821-4966; vanessa@ALMINC.net

Victor’s Landscaping, Inc.
Delia Patino
Maintenance Department Manager

602-439-5192; info@victorslandscaping.com

Note: The participating landscape company is hot employed by, or providing services on behalf of,
the City of Glendale. The company is an independent contractor that has agreed to perform certain
landscape services for Glendale residents at a negotiated rate. Residents that desire to take

advantage of these rates must contact the landscaping company directly. Residents should request

the Glendale Landscape Referral rate.

The City of Glendale is not party to any contract between the resident and the participating
landscape company. The City of Glendale does not guarantee or warranty the work of the company

in any manner.

Any billing, service questions or concerns are to be addressed with the company, not the City of
Glendale. The City of Glendale is not responsible for resolving any issues that may arise out of a
resident's use of the participating landscape company.



RESIDENTIAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES

CITY OF GLENDALE

Turf Care (Includes: Dead Tree Desert Landscape (Cost of Granite only) VALUE ADDED SERVICES:
Mowlneremuvalioiae, By A | emera R NN Doeett Install GRANITE
ARTISTICICAND Wy shrub | Removal dess | PO | Landecs Desert DELIVERY
MANAGEMENT | raking/blowing of | =100 than 12" oy bl Maimen:::'e L d" FEE
debris/leaves and 4 diameter) LB LS
dlameter) UPTO | 10,001 TO | 15.001 TO .
removal) g Licensed
10.000 SF | 15,000 SF | 22000 SF ,
LOT LOT LOT Irrigation Spray
Technician |Arborist Technician
(e $27.00|  $30.00 $50.00|  $75.00 $25.00{NO BID $5,395.00 $8,125.00| $11,916.00
time need only) $75.00 $25.00 $45.00 $45.00
HourTy Rate Discount $0.02 $0.02 $0.02 $0.02 $0.02|NO BID
Wonthly Rate $95.00 $25.00 N/A N/A $78.00|NO BID
Monthly Rate
Discount $0.02 $0.02 N/A N/A $0.02|NO BID
Bi-Monthly Rate $190.00 $50.00 N/A N/A $156.00|NO BID
CITY OF GLENDALE
RESIDENTIAL LANDSCAPING SERVICES
Turf Cate (Includes: oy Desert Landscape (Cost of Granite only) VALUE ADDED SERVICES:
. LT BTl 6 Tree / DL Removal Desert Install GRANITE
NIGIORS pesds; shrup | Romoval dless | .\ o than | Landscape | Desert DELIVERY
LANDSCAPING raking/blowing of | Lo than 12" 12" Mamte"azce Landscape UPTO | 10,001 TO | 15,001 TO FEE .
debris/leaves and E diameter) diameter) P 10,000 SF | 15.000 SF | 22.000 SF Imgathn
removal) LoT LOT LOT Inspection / |Pre Post Palm
Repait Emergent |Emergent [Trimming
Hourly Rate (one INSTALL
time need only) $165.00] $165.00 $165.00] $175.00 $150.00| 557 .5 $4,365.85| $7,303.04| $10,389.81 $75.00 §75.00 $75.00 $75.00] $95.00
COST OF $55 / per
Hourly Rate Discount $0.00;  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0-00)GraniTE. > | $6,966.58| $12,276.93| $15,306.00|man hour
[Monthly Rate $150.00] $150.00 N/A N/A $150.00
Monthly Rate
Divconnt $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A $0.00
=
Bi-Monthly Rate $80.00]  $80.00 N/A N/A $75.00




